
There are a number of ways you can contact or communicate with me 
this year 
 
I am located in the new 3-story building in room 305.  
 
My school email is: jcarlisle@fms.k12.nm.us 
 
Also find me @:  
 
FHS Gifted Website: first and foremost, our Gifted website is a prime 
place for general information, updates and events going on through 
FHS Gifted and FHS Rise. The website is on the general FHS website 
under the tab “resources”. 
- Facebook page: our Facebook page has been rebranded to showcase 
our FHS Rise. The link for this can be found 
https://www.facebook.com/fhsrise/ 
- FHS Remind: if you have not already signed up for this texting 
service, it is super easy. Just text the phrase “@fhsgift” to “81010”. 
You will get periodic updates about events going on in Gifted or at 
FHS or just reminders about testing dates, college trips or the such. 
We try not to blow up your phone, so we reserve the remind text 
feature for the more important or urgent messages.  
- Edsby: something new I am trying this year with my caseload is the 
Edsby page. Many of you have used Edsby before and know how 
simple it is. Basically, it is like an educational social media page; it 
looks very similar to Facebook. Every student and teacher are already 
on Edsby, as the district is using it more and more. I have an Edsby 
page with my whole caseload. If you log in to Edsby, you will see it 
listed on your course list as “EPO Caseload”. I am going to use this 
often to post information, questions or just random jokes I find funny. 
I encourage everyone to check in whenever they can. There is also an 
app you can get for your phone! 
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